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jpg"></p><p>他总是沉默寡言，Rarely do we hear his voice, but w
hen he speaks, it&#39;s like the sun breaking through the clouds
 on a gloomy day. He carries himself with an air of quiet confiden
ce, as if the weight of the world rests lightly upon his shoulders.
</p><p>He is our rock, our shelter from life&#39;s storms. His ca
lm demeanor and wise words have guided us through countless 
challenges. Even when faced with difficulties that seem insurmo
untable, he remains steadfast and unshaken. His strength is not 
just physical but also mental and emotional – a true pillar of sup
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lder than us by several years, he never fails to lend a helping han
d or offer sage advice whenever needed. Whether it&#39;s fixing 
a broken appliance or providing guidance during times of uncert
ainty, he is always there for us. His selflessness and generosity a
re qualities we admire greatly.</p><p>His love for learning kno
ws no bounds; he devours books like they&#39;re going out of st
yle. From history to science to philosophy, his thirst for knowled
ge is contagious – inspiring us all to broaden our horizons as wel
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vbmIRA0NmUvgl.jpg"></p><p>Even though we may not always 
agree on everything, there&#39;s one thing we can all agree on: 
no matter what life throws at him or any one of us in this family 
unit called home,&#34;就算是哥哥&#34; will be there to provide c
omfort and solace in times of need – a beacon shining brightly in
 the darkness that sometimes threatens to consume us whole.</
p><p>So here&#39;s to my brother: May your wisdom continue 
growing exponentially while your patience stays steady; may yo
ur heart stay full with love for everyone around you; may you al
ways find happiness in whatever path you choose; and most imp
ortantly - keep being that rock upon which our family stands tall
!</p><p><img src="/static-img/KsLMLzi362HCZlA3NaFUEhZ68k
RY6Btm_PUQ6qnag4J6TfxuC5ZwBTbMAIsvXQD0051DvYxz7KML
Azkih2OTwTDJQShCB4H7WF_xq1YrutJejJ3YSeb7qstRZOP5z6tk
6yyyvJQZNWSaHewjeoOhbF_ANNjoB1VD6qApvP2gesR9PJ15IfO
vbmIRA0NmUvgl.jpg"></p><p><a href = "/pdf/736561-家中的那
位哥哥.pdf" rel="alternate" download="736561-家中的那位哥哥.p
df"  target="_blank">下载本文pdf文件</a></p>


